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Weaponizing Fear  
 
We are in a battle for our freedom in America and we can’t back down! The enemy keeps pushing harder and harder to 
further their Socialistic agenda of a New World Order on America. This will greatly hinder our freedom of choice, our 
freedom of religion and our freedom of speech. I know Christians are tired of hearing about this, but if we ignore this it 
will be at our own destruction. How come the Progressives double-down and the Christians back-down?  
 
Every move of God will be challenged by the enemy. This is spiritual warfare, but it plays out in the physical realm 
through people. God has released a spirit of boldness upon America and upon Christians. This boldness is to stand up 
and fight against the darkness to make America great again by repairing the breach of our Constitution and our Christian 
heritage. This boldness will bring revival to the people and the soul of America.    
 
The enemy counter attacks the spirit of boldness with a spirit of fear to maintain control of their “revised” godless 
Constitution and over the people. Fear has been weaponized!  
 
James Goll is a very respected prophetic voice. He said God gave him a vision of a “Global Dragon Warfare Manual” and 
showed him “He who teaches people to fear will rule.” Right now, there are people in positions of power that are 
“teaching Americans how to fear” through false evidence appearing real. Yes there is a real virus, a real danger, but 
much of the evidence has been manipulated to look much worse in order to implement more control over people and 
our Constitution. FEAR: False Evidence Appearing Real. This evidence will have some truth, but it will be twisted.  
 
We were first told these quarantine procedures would only be implemented for a few weeks until the “curve” has 
flattened out. The curve flattened out, and they implemented stronger controls, threatening to go as long as 18 months.  
 
We were first told this virus could cause over 2 million deaths, then 1 million, then 200,000, then 100,000 thousand. This 
decrease is not good for their narrative, because the more deaths mean more fear. So the people in charge manipulated 
the evidence by having doctors and hospitals increase the death toll on death certificates by marking the cause of death 
from Covid 19 even if the person was not tested, but if they had any “lung issues” that could possibly indicate Covid 19.  
 
Why would any honest doctor or medical professional be so dishonest? Simple, offer them money and come down on 
anyone who challenges the process causing fear. We will never know for sure how many people actually died form Covid 
19. Some professionals are now estimating it is less than ½ of 1 percent. People in hospitals will thing the death rate is 
higher because by the time a person with Covid 19 goes to the hospital, they are very, very sick.  
 
Since the curve has gone down, they bring in more fear with a “second wave” possibility, warning this could kill more 
people than the first wave!  Every year we have a “wave” of the flu virus sweep across America and kill 40 to 60,000 
Americans and never have shut down the entire country.  
 
Why now? I believe to destroy our economy and change the election process by mail-in votes that are virtually 
impossible to monitor or verify. Tamper with the election process somehow in order to manipulate the results.  
 
More fear tactics: intimidate people to get on board the fear train by “mask shaming.” People fear if they don’t wear a 
mask, even if they don’t believe it is necessary, they will be ridiculed by others…and it is happening. The top doctor in 
America, the head of CDC Dr. Anthony Fauci refuses to wear a mask, and so does our President. Why then are we 
expected to wear one?  
 
Good thing: Doctors are asking people who have had Covid 19 and developed antibodies to donate their blood plasma 
because it could help cure others.  
 
 
 



Fear tactic: I just heard from someone in the medical profession, people should not breath easy knowing they could 
have developed antibodies, because people are being re-infected.  If we know that people who had Covid 19 actually 
developed antibodies through testing, how could others be re-infected? Is this true or false evidence? A basic fact about 
our immune system is if it is healthy it will develop antibodies, unless the person is overcome by the virus.  
 
The Governors in America are standing in the spot light like never before. The citizens of each state eagerly await the 
next “Executive Order” to see if the restrictions that are controlling everyone’s life will be less burdensome or more 
restrictive. People are rallying together to protest at the state capitals, while other people are protesting against the 
protesters. Which Governors are more concerned about their people, and which Governors are more concerned about 
their careers and power? How they govern will give us the answer.  
 
Whether the Governors realize it or not, their “fruit” is being exposed. You can say one thing, but your fruit will expose 
your true character. Matt 12:33-37 Jesus said “A tree will be known by it’s fruit.” It is either good or bad; not both.  
 
We are in the 50 days of Pentecost which started at Passover-Resurrection and is completed on Pentecost/Shavuot on 
May 30-31. In the United States there are 50 Governors. I believe by Pentecost the “fruit of their spirit” will be exposed.   
 
Generalizing for the sake of learning, there are 2 types of leaders.  
 
Servant-Leader: One who cares about the people more than his position or power and the reason he is a leader is to 
serve people. They give people the freedom of choice believing our unalienable rights in our Constitution come from our  
Creator God. Give people the truth, a practical solution and allow them the right to choose. This is biblical based 
leadership.  
 
Lord-Leader: One who is more concerned about their career and maintaining power than the people they rule over. 
They control people through more regulations, excessive fines, fear, intimidation while manipulating evidence to fit their 
narrative. They treat people as ignorant, deplorable and uncapable of making their own choices, thus the need for more 
regulation. They believe Constitutional rights come from man, not God and therefore the Constitution can be “revised” 
and those rights removed.   
 
Matt 20:25,26 But Jesus called them to Himself and said, "You know that the rulers of the Gentiles lord it over them, and 
those who are great exercise authority over them.  26 Yet it shall not be so among you; but whoever desires to become 
great among you, let him be your servant.  
 
“The Faithful and the Evil Servant” 
Matt 24:45-47 "Who then is a faithful and wise servant, whom his master made ruler over his household, to give them 
food in due season?  46 Blessed is that servant whom his master, when he comes, will find so doing.  47 Assuredly, I say 
to you that he will make him ruler over all his goods. 48 But if that evil servant says in his heart, 'My master is delaying 
his coming,'  49 and begins to beat his fellow servants, and to eat and drink with the drunkards,  50 the master of that 
servant will come on a day when he is not looking for him and at an hour that he is not aware of,  51 and will cut him in 
two and appoint him his portion with the hypocrites. There shall be weeping and gnashing of teeth.  
  
Jesus said in the last days, we will be hated for His name’s sake; standing up for righteousness, but He said “Do not fear 
them because what they are doing will be exposed!  
  
Matt 10:22 And you will be hated by all for My name's sake. But he who endures to the end will be saved. 
 
Matt 10:26 Therefore do not fear them. For there is nothing covered that will not be revealed, and hidden that will not 
be known.  
 
 
 
 



 
Fear as to Caution: 
Fear is not from God and there is a difference between fear and caution. We need to be cautious, not fearful. Caution 
gives a person the right to “proceed with caution.” Fear immobilizes and paralyzes a person and puts them in bondage.  
 
Caution allows us to proceed forward with wisdom.  
 
 
Satan is called the “Accuser” and will accuse people of what he is guilty of…lies, fear and hatred.  
 
Recently, Franklin Graham, Billy Graham’s son, called for Christians leaders to stand with him and pray for President 
Trump. He said the attacks against Trump are demonic and that the President has been attacked by the media more 
than any other President in modern history even more than Abraham Lincoln.  
 
The hatred against President Trump is almost surreal, almost unbelievable. What laws has he implemented that would 
cause such a demonic hatred? Please be praying for our President for protection against the demonic, and the wisdom 
and boldness to make America great again, standing strong against globalist, Progressives and the New World Order.  
 
 
We pray and proclaim; Lord, expose the unfruitful works of darkness, those who swear falsely by Your Name, those who 
put evil for good, and good for evil and make laws against the righteous man! Expose the false evidence appearing real 
about the Covid 19. We bind and rebuke the fear and the lies as we proceed with caution.   
 
We pray and proclaim a spirit of boldness of miracle working power of Your Holy Spirit to be upon Your people, because 
we are not ashamed of the Gospel of Jesus Christ.  
 
Are you in fear?  
Do you know how to trust in the Lord Jesus Christ?  
Do you know how to fight against the darkness in spiritual warfare?  
 
We would like to send you a free book that will explain what is happening right now in America called the Final Battle; 
America is Divided. It is free, just go to not-ashamed.org.  
 
God gave us the Holy Spirit, the greatest power in the universe so we could live in righteousness, peace and joy 
regardless of what is happening around us.  
 
Have you given your life to Jesus Christ? Have you asked the Holy Spirit to fill you?  


